DRAFT

TELANGANA STATE ELECTRICITY REGULATORY COMMISSION

Amendment of General Terms and Conditions of Supply- Approval — Issued-Reg.

Proceedings No: TSERC/Secy/ -16/2016 Dated: .09.2016

Read the following:

During the public hearings of Aggregate Revenue Requirement and Retail Supply
Tariffs for FY 2016-17 , the Telangana State Electricity Regulatory Commission has
received several requests from many stakeholders for reduction of Minimum
agreement period from 2 years to 1 year.

2) After careful consideration, the Commission proposes to amend the General
Terms and Conditions of Supply (GTCS). Accordingly the Commission hereby
approves the following amendment to the GTCS approved vide proceedings No.

Secy/01/2006 dated 06-01-2006 and amended from time to time.

3) In Clause 5.9.3.1, for the words “two years”, the words “one year” shall be
substituted.

4) In Clause 5.9.3.2, for the words “two years”, the words “one year” shall be
substituted.

5) In Clause 5.9.4.2, for the words “two years”, the words “one year” shall be
substituted.

6) The order will come into force with effect from _ September,2016 and will
supersede all earlier orders. The Distribution Licensees shall make available the
copies of this GTCS (Amendment) , Proceedings at all their offices down to the
Section Level for reference by any consumer who desires to refer to the same

during working hours.

This proceeding is signed by the Telangana State Electricity Regulatory Commission
on ___ September, 2016.

: ’%’/‘»‘E = ’)_4//(0:4_‘

COMMISSION SECRETARY



